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Information General Terms and
Conditions of Performers and Artists The
BMG Rights Management Group GmbH
(“BMG”, Legal successor to GEMA),
Berlin-based company is the exclusive
German performer rights management
company for public performances of
musical works by German and
international recording artists. The BMG
Rights Management Group GmbH is the
collective rights management company of
EMI Musikverlagsgesellschaft mbH, a
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German corporation headquartered in
Frankfurt. For the performance of
musical works, the performer is granted a
specific licensing agreement that grants
the right to perform, for example at
concerts, at theaters or in bars, a pre-
specified number of times or for a
specified period of time. In a specific
text, each performer is informed about
the terms and conditions for granting this
performance license.The present
invention relates to an information reader
and more particularly to a recorder-
reproducer of digitally encoded
information. A recorder-reproducer is a
device which is relatively inexpensive in
construction, and relatively convenient to
use, while enabling a user of the device to
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record, reproduce and further process
recorded information in an aural and/or
visual format. Most conventional recorder-
reproducer devices operate by decoding a
digitally encoded signal, recording the
signal, then playing back the recorded
signal to reproduce the information
recorded on the signal. Some recorder-
reproducer devices include the ability to
playback a recorded signal in combination
with the ability to edit the recorded signal.
Such recorder-reproducer devices are
referred to as recorders and recorders.
Problems exist with respect to
conventional recorder and recorder-
reproducer devices in that they only
record and playback digitally encoded
signals. For example, in addition to
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recording analog signals, such
conventional recorder and recorder-
reproducer devices are unable to add,
delete or otherwise modify analog signals.
Recently, the digital video industry has
standardized the transmission of analog
signals in the form of composite video
signals. The common video standard of
MPEG-2 is capable of transmitting an
information stream or signal in a digital
format which preserves much of the
information intended to be transmitted
from the analog format to the digital
format.
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